
ljdkjh xtV] mRrj izns’k
mRrj izns’kh; ljdkj }kjk izdkf’kr

vlk/kkj.k
fo/kk;h ifjf’k””Ô~V
Hkkx&2] [k.M ¼d½
¼mRrj izns’k v/;kns’k½

y[kuÅ] c‘gLifrokj] 21 uoEcj] 2002
dkfrZd 30] 1924 ’kd lEor~

mRrj izns’k ljdkj
fo/kk;h vuqHkkx&1

&&&&&&&
la[;k 2023@l=g&fo-1&2¼d½22&2002

y[kuÅ uoEcj] 2002
&&&&

vf/klwpuk
&&&&

fofo/k

  lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 213 ds [k.M ¼1½ }kjk izkIr ’kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djds] jkT;iky
egksn; us fuEufyf[kr mRrj izns’k uxj fuxe ¼la’kks/ku½ v/;kns’k] 2002 ¼mRrj izns’k
v/;kns’k la[;k 20 lu~ 2002½ iz[;kfir fd;k gS tks bl vf/klwpuk }kjk loZlk/kkj.k dh
lwpukFkZ izdkf’kr fd;k tkrk gSA

mRrj izns’k uxj fuxe ¼la’kks/ku½ v/;kns’k 2002
¼mRrj izns’k v/;kns’k la[;k 20 lu~ 2002½

¼Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds frjiuosa o”ÔZ esa jkT;iky }kjk iz[;kfir]½

mRrj izns’k uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1959 dk vxzrj la’kks/ku djus ds fy;s

v/;kns’k

pw¡fd jkT; fo/kku e.My l= esa ugha gS vkSj jkT;iky dk ;g lek/kku gks x;k gS
fd ,slh ifjfLFkfr;kWa fo|eku gSa ftuds dkj.k mUgs rqjUr dk;Zokgh djuk vko’;d gks
x;k gS(

vr,o] vc lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 213 ds [k.M ¼1½ }kjk iznRk ’kfDr dk iz;ksx
djds jkT;iky fuEufyf[kr v/;kns’k iz[;kfir djrs gS%&
1& ;g v/;kns’k mRrj izns’k uxj fuxe ¼la’kks/ku½ v/;kns’k] 2002 dgk tk;sxkA

        laf{kIr uke



2& mRrj izns’k uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1959 esa] ftls vkxs ewy vf/kfu;e dgk
x;k gS] ’kCn ^^eq[; uxj vf/kdkjh^^ ^^vij eq[; uxj vf/kdkjh^^ ^^mi uxj vf/kdkjh^^
^^lgk;d uxj vf/kdkjh^^ ^^uxj izeq[k^^ ^^mi uxj izeq[k^^ ^^lHkkln^^ vkSj lHkklnksa tgkWa
dgh Hkh vk;s gksa] ’kh”””””””””ÔZd] mi’kh”ÔZd vkSj ik’oZ’khÔZd ds LFkku ij dze’k% ’kCn ^^uxj
vk;qDr^^ ^^vij uxj vk;qDr^^ ^^mi uxj vk;qDr^^ ^^lgk;d uxj vk;qDr^^ ^^egkikSj^^
^^mi egkikSj^^ ^^ikÔZn^^ vkSj ^^ik”ÔZnksa^^ j[k fn;s tk;saxsA

   mRrj izns’k vfÌfu;e la[;k 2 lu~ 1959 dk lkekU; la’kks/ku

3& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5 esa] [k.M ¼?k½ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[k fn;k
tk;sxk] vFkkZr~ %&   /kkjk 5 dk laaas’kks/ku

^^¼?k½ bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu fuxe ds fy, fu;qDr ,d uxj vk;qDr vkSj ,d ;k
vf/kd vij uxj vk;qDr fu;qDr djrs gSaA^^
4& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 16 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[k nh tk;sxh] vFkkZr~%&

         /kkjk 16 dk izfrLFkkiu

   ^^16 ¼1½ tgka jkT; ljdkj dks ;g fo’okl djus dk dkj.k gks fd]&
¼d½ egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj dh rjQ ls vius drZO;ksa ds fu”iknu esa dksbZ pwd gqbZ

gS(
¼[k½ egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj us]&

¼,d½ /kkjk 11 vkSj 25 esa mfYyf[kr dksbZ vugZrk mixr dj yh gS( ;k
¼nks½ /kkjk 463 ds vFkkZUrxZr fuxe ds lkFk mlds }kjk ;k mldh vksj ls]

fdlh lafonk ;k lsok;kstu esa izR;{k ;k vizR;{k :i ls ;k fdlh Hkkxhnkj }kjk
dksbZ va’k ;k fgr] pkgs /ku lEcU/kh gks ;k fdlh vU; izdkj dk gks] tkucw> dj
vftZr fd;k gS( ;k

¼rhu½ tkucw> dj fdlh ,sls ekeys esa] ftlesa mldk izR;{k ;k vizR;{k
:i ls ;k fdlh Hkkxhnkj }kjk dksbZ va’k ;k fgr gks] pkgs og /ku lEcU/kh gks ;k
fdlh vU; izdkj dk gks ;k fdlh eqofDdy] ekfyd ;k vU; O;fDr dh vksj ls
mldk oðfRrd #i esa fgr Fkk( ;k egkikSj ;k mi&egkikSj ;k ik”ÔZn ds #i esa
tkucw> dj fdlh ,sls ekeys esa] dk;Z fd;k gS( ;k

¼pkj½ fuxe ds izca/k esa lkSih xbZ fdlh utwy Hkwfe ds lac/k esa fdlh okn
;k vU; fof/kd dk;Zokgh esa fdlh O;fDr dh vksj ls uxj fuxe ds fo#) ;k
jkT; ljdkj ds fo#) fof/k O;olk;h ds #i es  dk;Z fd;k gS ;k mifLFkr gqvk
gSa ;k fdlh ,sls O;fDr ds fy, ;k mlds fy;s ftlds fo#) uxj fuxe }kjk ;k
mldh vksj ls vkijkf/kd dk;Zokgh lafLFkr dh xbZ  gks] dk;Z fd;k gS ;k mifLFkr
gqvk gS( ;k

ü¼ikap½ fuxe ds uxjikfydk {ks= esa vius lkekU; fuokl LFkku dk
ifjR;kx dj fn;k gS( ;k

¼N%½ vius drZO;ksa ds fuoZgu esa vopkj dk nksÔh jgk gS( ;k
¼lkr½ fuxe ds pkyw ;k iwoZorhZ dk;Zdky esa egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj ;k

fdlh lfefr ds lHkkifr ;k ik”ÔZn ds #i esa ;k fdlh vU; gSfl;r ls] pkgs tks
Hkh gks] dk;Z djrs gq, vius in dk bruk ?kksj nq#i;ksx fd;k gS ;k bl vf/kfu;e
ds fdlh mica/k ;k fdlh fu;e] fofu;e ;k mifof/k dk tkucw> dj mYy/kau
fd;k gS ;k fuxe dh fuf/k ;k lEifRr dks ,slh gkfu ;k {kfr igqWpk;h gS tks mls



egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj cus jgus ds v;ksX; cuk nsrh gS( ;k
¼vkB½ fdlh vU; vopkj dk nks”Ôh gS pkgs ,slk vopkj mlus egkikSj ds

#i esa mi&egkikSj ds #i esa ;k ikÔZn ds #i esa fd;k gks( ;k
¼ukS½ fuxe ds fgr ds izfrdwy dk;Z fd;k gS( ;k
¼nl½ fuxe dh fdlh cSBd esa bl izdkj ls ck/kk mRiUu dh gS fd

fuxe dk ml cSBd dk dk;Z lapkyu vlaHko gks tk; ;k ,slk djus ds fy;
fdlh dks nqÔ~”izsfjr fd;k gS( ;k

¼X;kjg½ bl vf/kfu;e ds vk/khu fn;s x;s jkT; ljdkj ds fdlh vkns’k
;k funsZ’k dk tkucw> dj mYy?kau fd;k gS( ;k

¼ckjg½ fuxe ds vf/kdkfj;ks ;k deZpkfj;ksa ds lkFk nqO;Zogkj fd;k gS(  ;k
¼rsjg½ fuxe dh fdlh lEifRr dk mlds cktkj ewY; ls de ewY; ij

O;;u fd;k gS( flok; jkT; ljdkj ds funsZ’kksa dks NksMdj( ;k
¼pkSng½ fuxe dh Hkwfe] Hkou ;k fdlh vU; vpy lEifRr ij vfrØe.k

fd;k gS ;k fdlh vU; O;fDr dks vfrØe.k djus esa lgk;rk dh ;k nq”Ô~izsfjr
fd;k gS(

rks og mlls uksfVl esa fofuZfnÔ~””””V vof/k ds Hkhrj ;g dkj.k crkus dh
vis{kk dj ldsxh fd D;ksa us mls in ls gVk fn;k tk;A

    ¼2½ jkT; ljdkj] egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj }kjk fn;s x;s fdlh Li”Ô~Vhdj.k ij fopkj
djus ds i’pkr vkSj ,slh tkap djus ds i’pkr tSlh og vko’;d le>s] dkj.kksa dks
vfHkfyf[kr djrs gq;s egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj dks mlds in ls gVk ldsxhA
    ¼3½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds v/khu jkT; ljdkj }kjk fn;k x;k dksbZ vkns’k vfUre gksxk vkSj
ml ij fdlh U;k;ky; esa vkis{k ugha fd;k tk;sxkA
    ¼4½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ ds v/khu gVk;k x;k egkSikj ;k mi egkikSj] ik”ÔZn Hkh ugha jg
tk;sxk vkSj mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds [k.M ¼d½ vkSj ¼[k½ esa mfYyf[kr fdlh vk/kkj ij gVk;s tkus
dh n’kk esa ,sls gVk;s tkus ds fnukad ls ikap oÔZ dh vof/k rd egkikSj ;k mi egkikSj
ds :i esa iqufuZokZpu dk ik= ugha gksxkA**

5&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25 esa]&                                              /kkjk 25 dk la’kks/ku

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa [k.M ¼?k½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[k fn;k tk;sxk]
vFkkZr %&

^^¼?k½ og jkT; ljdkj vFkok dsUnzh; ljdkj vFkok fdlh LFkkuh;
izkfÏÏÌdkjh ;k jkT; ljdkj ;k dsUnzh; ljdkj ds LokfeRok/khu ;k fu;a=.kk/khu
fdlh miØe ;k fudk; dh lsok esa gksa vFkok fMfLVªDV xouZesaV dkmUlsy vFkok
vij ;k lgk;d fMfLVªDV xouZesaV dkmUlsy vFkok voSrfud eftLVªsV vFkok
voSrfud eqaflQ vFkok voSrfud vflLVsaV dysDVj gks]**
¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa] [k.M ¼2½ ds i’pkr fuEufyf[kr [k.M c<+k fn;s tk;saxs] vFkkZr

%&
¼3½ fuxe dh fdlh cSBd esa bl izdkj ls ck/kk mRiUu dh gS fd fuxe

dk ml cSBd dk dk;Z lapkyu vlEHko gks tk; vFkok ,slk djus ds fy;s fdlh
dks mdlk;k gS( ;k

¼4½ fuxe ds fdlh vf/kdkjh ;k deZpkjh ds lkFk nqO;Zogkj fd;k gS( ;k



¼5½ izR;{k ;k vizR;{k :i ls] fuxe dh fdlh lEifRr dks dksbZ gkfu ;k
{kfr igqapk;h gS ;k fdlh vU; O;fDr dks ,slh gkfu ;k {kfr ds fy;s nq”Ô~izsfjr
djrk gS ( ;k

¼6½ fdlh vijk/k ds fy;s ftlesa jkT; ljdkj dh jk; esa] uSfrd v/kerk
vUrxzZLr gS] fl)nks”Ô Bgjk;k tk;A**

6&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 132 esa %&           /kkjk 132 dk la’kks/ku

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼3½ esa ’kCn ^^,d yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** vkSj
’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s** j[k fn;s tk;saxsA
¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼3½ ds i’pkr fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk c<+k nh tk;sxh] vFkkZr %&

^^¼3&d½ dksbZ ,slh lafonk] ftlesa nks yk[k #i;s ls vf/kd vkSj ik¡p yk[k #i;s
ls vuf/kd dk O;; vUrxzZLr gks] uxj vk;qDr }kjk rc rd ugha dh tk;sxh tc rd fd
mls egkikSj }kjk Lohd‘r u dj fn;k tk;A**

¼x½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa ’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s**
j[k fn;s tk;saxs (

¼?k½ mi/kkjk ¼5½ esa ’kCn ^^ipkl gtkj #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^,d yk[k #i;s**
vkSj ’kCn ^^,d yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nks yk[k #i;s** j[k fn;s tk;saxs(

¼M-½ mi/kkjk ¼6½ ds i’pkr fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk c<+k nh tk;sxh] vFkkZr %&
¼7½ jkT; ljdkj xtV esa vf/klwpuk }kjk] mi/kkjk ¼3½ ;k mi/kkjk ¼4½ ;k mi/kkjk ¼5½ esa
fofuZfn”V vkfFkZd lhekvksa dks ykxr esa o‘f) ;k dk;Z dh vR;ko’;drk vkSj fuxeksa dh
n{krk dks n‘f”V esa j[krs gq, mikUrfjr dj ldrh gSA**
7&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkj 135 esa %&           /kkjk 135 dk la’kks/ku

¼d½ ik’oZ ’kh”ÔZd esa ’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s**
j[k fn;s tk;saxsA

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa &
¼,d½ ’kCn ̂ ^,d yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ̂ ^nks yk[k #i;s** j[k fn;s

tk;saxs (
¼nks½ izfrcU/kkRed [k.M fudky fn;k tk;sxk (

¼x½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds i’pkr fuEufyf[kr mi/kkjk c<+k nh tk;sxh vFkkZr %&
^^¼1&d½ egkikSj fdlh r[kehus dh tks ik¡p yk[k #i;s ls vf/kd u gks]

Lohd‘fr ns ldrk gS (
¼?k½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa ’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s**

j[k fn;s tk;saxsA

8&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 136 esa]& /kkjk 136 dk la’kks/ku

¼d½ ik’oZ ’khÔZd esa ’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s**
j[k fn;s tk;saxsA

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ’kCn ^^ik¡p yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s**
j[k fn;s tk;saxs (

¼x½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa [k.M ¼d½ esa] ’kCn ^^nl yk[k #i;s** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^chl



yk[k #i;s** j[k fn;s tk;saxs (

9&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 177 esa]& /kkjk 177 dk la’kks/ku

¼d½ [k.M ¼x½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[k fn;k tk;sxk] vFkkZr %&
^^¼x½ Hkou] tks jkT; ljdkj }kjk lapkfyr vkSj izcaf/kr vFkok lgk;frr Ldwyksa vkSj
b.VjehfM,V dkystksa ds #i esa gh iz;qDr gksrs gks (**

¼[k½ [k.M ¼t½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[k fn;k tk;sxk] vFkkZr %&
^^¼t½ Hkou Lokeh }kjk v/;kflr vkoklh; Hkouksa tks fdlh ,sls {ks= esa gks] ftls ik¡p o”ÔZ
ds Hkhrj fuxe dh lhek esa lfEefyr fd;k x;k gks vFkok ml {ks= esa lM+d] is;ty vkSj
ekxZ izdk’k dh lqfo/kk,a miyC/k djk nh xbZ gks] tks Hkh igys gksA**

10&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 207 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[k nh tk;sxh]
vFkkZr %&        /kkjk 207 dk izfrLFkkiu

^^207&uxj vk;qDr le;&le; ij fu;ekoyh esa fofgr jhfr ds vuqlkj uxj ;k
mlds fdlh Hkkx dh {ks=okj fdjk;k nj vkSj fu/kkZj.k lwph rS;kj djk;sxkA**

        fu/kkZj.k lwph dk rS;kj fd;k tkuk

11&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 207&d ds i’pkr~ fuEufyf[kr /kkjk c<+k nh tk;sxh]
vFkkZr %&    /kkjk 207&[k dk c<+k;k tkuk

‡^^207&[k ¼1½ okf”””ÔZd fdjk;s ds ewY; ds iz;kstuksa ds fy;s izR;sd Hkou ;k Hkwfe dk Lokeh
;k v/;klh ,sls fnukad rd tSlk fofgr fd;k tk; ,d lEifRr fooj.kh izLrqr djsxkA**
¼2½ dksbZ O;fDr tks fcuk mfpr dkj.kksa ds mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa fufnŹ Ô~V fooj.kh izLrqr djus esa
foQy jgk gks] og ,slh ’kkfLr ds tSlh fofgr dh tk;] Hkqxrku djus dk nk;h gksxkA
¼3½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa fufnŹ Ô~V ’kkfLr dk iz’keu uxj vk;qDr }kjk fd;k tk ldsxkA

dj fu/kkZj.k ds fy;s Hkouksa ;k Hkwfe;ksa dk fooj.k izLrqr fd;k tkuk

12&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 208 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[k nh tk;sxh]
vFkkZr %&        /kkjk 208 dk izfrLFkkiu

^^208&uxj vk;qDr /kkjk 207 ds v/khu rS;kj dh xbZ lwph dk izdk’ku fu;ekoyh esa
fofgr jhfr ds vuqlkj djsxkA**     lwph dk izdk’ku

13&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 209 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[k nh tk;sxh] vFkkZr
%&         /kkjk 209 dk izfrLFkkiu

^^209&uxj vk;qDr ;k mlds }kjk bl fufeRr izkf/kd‘r dksbZ vf/kdkjh fu;ekoyh esa
fofgr jhfr ds vuqlkj vkifRr;ksa dk fuiVkjk djsxkA**       izLrkfor njksa rFkk lwph ij vkifRr;ka

14&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 210 esa] mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[k nh



tk;sxh] vFkkZr %& /kkjk 210 dk la’kks/ku

^^¼1½ uxj vk;qDr ;k mlds }kjk bl fufeRr izkf/kd‘r dksbZ vf/kdkjh ;FkkfLFkfr]
uxj ;k mlds fdlh Hkkx dh {ks=okj fdjk;k njksa vkSj fu/kkZj.k lwph dks vius gLrk{kj ls
vf/kizekf.krd‘r djsxkA**
15&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 213 esa] mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ’kCn ̂ ^dk;Zdkfj.kh lfefr vFkok ,rnFkZ
fu;qDr dh x;h mldh dksbZ milfefr** ds LFkku ij ’kCn ^^uxj vk;qDr ;k mlds }kjk
bl fufeRr izkf/kd`r dksbZ vf/kdkjh** j[k fn;s tk;saxsA /kkjk 213 dk la’kks/ku

16&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 214 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr /kkjk j[k nh tk;sxh vFkkZr
%&         /kkjk 214 dk izfrLFkkiu

^^214&¼1½ tc fdlh Hkou dk fuekZ.k ;k iqufuZekZ.k vFkok mlesa dksbZ foLrkj
mlds Lokeh ;k v/;klh }kjk fd;k tk; vkSj vkPNkfnr {ks=Qy 25 izfr’kr ls vf/kd gks
tk;] rks og lekiu ds fnukad ds vFkok v/;klu ds fnukad ds] tks Hkh igys gks] lkB fnu
ds Hkhrj uxj vk;qDr dks mldh lwpuk fofgr izi= esa vfuok;Z :i ls nsxkA

    la’kks/ku ds iz;kstuksa ds fy, lwpuk nsus dh ck/;rk

¼2½ ,sls Lokeh ;k v/;klh] tks fcuk mfpr dkj.k ds mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa fufnŹ Ô~V lwpuk
izLrqr ugha djrs gSa] ,sls tqekZus ls] tks fu/kkZfjr lkekU; dj ds nksxquk ds cjkcj dh
Ìujkf’k ;k 500 #0 izfrfnu tks Hkh de gks] rd gks ldrk gS] nf.Mr fd;s tkus ds Hkkxh
gksaxsA

¼3½ uxj vk;qDr mi/kkjk ¼2½ “ds v/khu izLrkfor ’kkfLr dk iz’keu dj ldsxkA**

fo””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””””Ô~.kqdkUr ’kkL=h]
jkT;iky]

mRrj izns’kA

&&&&&&&&&&&“
vkKk ls]

,0ch0 ’kqDyk]
izeq[k lfpoA

&&&&&&&&&



No.2032 (2)/XVII-V-I-2(KA)-22-2002
Dated Lucknow, November 21,2002

In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Con-
stitution, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following
English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam (Sanshodhan)
Adhyadesh, 2002(Uttar Pradesh Adhyadesh Sankhya 20 of 2002 promul-
gated by the Governor.

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT)
ORDINANCE, 2002

(U.P. ORDINANCE NO. 20 OF 2002)
(Promulgated by the Governor in the Fifty-third Year of the

Republic of India)

AN

ORDINANCE

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959.

WHEREAS the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor
is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take
immediate action ;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause
(1) of Article 213 of the Constitution, the Governor is pleased to promulgate
the following Ordinance :-

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal
Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance, 2002  Short title

2. In the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959, hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act, for the words “Mukhya Nagar Adhikari”, “Apar
Mukhya Nagar Adhikari”, “Upa Nagar Adhikari”, “Sahayak Nagar Adhikari”,
“Nagar Pramukh”, “Upa Nagar Pramukh”, “Sabhasad” and “Sabhasads”
wherever occuring, including headings, Sub- headings and marginal head-
ings, the words “Municipal Commissioner”, “Additional Municipal Commis-
sioner”, “Deputy Municipal Commissioner”, “Assistant Municipal Commis-
sioner”, “Mayor”, “Deputy Mayor”, “Corporator” and “Corporators” shall re-
spectively be substituted. General amendment in U.P. Act No. 2 of 1959

3. In section 5 of the principal Act, for clause (d) the following clause
shall be substituted, namely :-   Amendment of section 5

“(d) a Municipal Commissioner and one or more Additional Municipal
Commissioner appointed for the Corporation under this Act.”
4. For section 16 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

substituted namely :- Substitution of section 16

Removal of Mayor and Deputy Mayor -
“16 (1) Where the State Government has, reason to believe that -

(a) there has been a failure on the part of the Mayor or the
Deputy Mayor in performing his duties ;

(b) the Mayor of Deputy Mayor has -



(i) incurred any of the disqualifications mentioned in section 11
of 25; or

(ii) within the meaning of section 463 Knowingly acquired, di-
rectly or indirectly or by partner, any share or interest, whether pecu-
niary or of any other nature, in any contract or employment with by or
on behalf of the Corporation; or

(iii) Knowingly acted as a Mayor or Deputy Mayor or as a Cor-
porator in matter, in which he has, directly or indirectly or by a partner;
any share or interest  whether pecuniary or of any other nature, or in
which he was professionally interested or on behalf of a client, princi-
pal or other person; or

(iv)  acted or appeared as a legal practitioner in any suit or
other legal proceeding on  behalf of any person against the Corpora-
tion or against  the State  Government in respect of nazul land en-
trusted to the management of the Corporation, or acted or appeared
for or on behalf of any person against whom a criminal proceeding
has been instituted by or on behalf of the Corporation or,

(v) abandoned his ordinary place of residence in the Municipal
area of the Corporation; or

(vi) been guilty of misconduct in the discharge of his duties; or
(vii) during the  current or the preceding term of the Corpora-

tion while acting as Mayor  or Deputy Mayor or as Chairperson of a
Committee or as Coporator or in any other capacity whatsoever, so
flagrantily  abused his  position, or so wilfully contravened any of  the
provisions of this Act or any rules, regulation or by-laws made there-
under or caused such loss or  damage to fund of property of  the
Corporation  as to render him  unfit to continue to  be  Mayor or Deputy
Mayor; or

(viii) been guilty of  any other misconduct whether   committed
as  Mayor or as Deputy  Mayor; or as  a  corporator;

(ix) acted   against the   interest of the   Corporation;  or
(x) created   on  obstacle in a meeting  of  the Corporation  in

such manner that it  becomes impossible for the Corporation to con-
duct its business in the meeting or  instigated  some one   to do  so; or

(xi) wilfully contravened any order or  direction of the State
Government given  under  this Act; or

(xii) misbehaved with the officers or employees of the Corpora-
tion; or

(xiii) disposed of any property belonging to the corporation at a
price less then its market value except the directions of state Govern-
ment; or

(xiv) encroached or assisted or instigated any other person to
encroach upon the land, building or any other immovable property of
the corporation.

it may call upon him to show cause with in the time to be specified
in the notice why he should not be removed from  office.

(2) After considering any explanation that may be offered by the
Mayor or Deputy Mayor and making such enquiry as it may consider



necessary, the State Government may for the reasons to be recorded
in writing, remove the Mayor or the Deputy Mayor from his office.

(3) An order passed by the State Government under sub-section
(2) shall be final and shall not be questioned in any court of low.

(4) The Mayor or the Deputy Mayor removed under sub-section(2)
shall also cease to be a Corporator and in case of removal on any of
the grounds mentioned in clauses (a) and(b) of sub-section(1) shall
not be eligible for re-election as Mayor or Deputy Mayor for a period of
five years from the date of such removal,”

5. In section 25 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 25

(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (d), the following clause shall be sub-
stituted, namely:-

“(d) is in the service of a State Government or the Central Gov-
ernment or any local authority or any undertaking or body owned or con-
trolled by a State Government or the Central Government or is a District
Government Counsel or an Additional or Assistant District Government
Counsel or an Honorary Magistrate or an Honorary Munsif or an Honor-
ary Assistant Collector”

(b) in sub-section (4), after clause (ii) the following clauses shall be
inserted, namely :-

“(iii) has created an obstacle in a meeting of the Corporation in
such manner that it becomes impossible for the corporation to conduct its
business in the meeting or instigated some one to do so; or

(iv) has misbehaved with any officer or employee of the Corporation;
or

(v) has directly or indirectly caused any loss or damage to  any prop-
erty of the Corporation or abets any other person to cause such loss or
damage; or

(vi) is convicted for an offence which, in the opinion of the State Gov-
ernment  involves moral turpitude;”

6. In section 132 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 132

(a) in sub section (3), for the words “ one lakh rupees “ the words “ five
lakh rupees” and for the words “five lakh rupees” the words “ten lakh rupees
“ shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely
:-

“(3-A) No contract involving an expenditure exceeding two lakh ru-
pees and not exceeding five lakh rupees shall be made by the Municipal
Commissioner unless it has been sanctioned by the Mayor.”;

(c) in sub-section (4), for the words” five lakh rupees “, the words “ten
lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-section (5), for the words “fifty thousand rupees” the words
“one lakh rupees” and for the words  “one lakh rupees”, the words, “two lakh
rupees “ shall be substituted;

(e) after sub-section (6) the following sub-section shall be inserted namely
:-



“(7) The State Government may, by notification in the Gazette, modify
the monetary limits specified in sub-section (3) or sub-section (4) or sub-
section (5) keeping in view the rise in costs or the exigencies of work and
efficiency of Corporations.”

7. In section 135 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 135

(a) In the marginal heading for words “ five lakh rupees” the words “ten
lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

(b) In sub-section (1),-
            (i) for the words “one lakh rupees “ the words “two lakh rupees “
shall be substituted.
            (ii) the proviso shall be omitted.
(c) after sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely
:-

(1-A) the Mayor may sanction any estimate not exceeding five lakh
rupees.
(d) in sub-section (2) for the words “ five lakh rupees” the words “ten lakh

rupees “ shall be substituted.

8. In section 136 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 136

(a) In the marginal heading for the words “five lakh rupees “ the words
“ten lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (1), for the words “five lakh rupees “ the words “ten lakh
rupees” shall be substituted.

(c) in sub-section (2), in clause (a) for the words “ten lakh rupees” the
words “twenty lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

9. In section 177 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 177

(a) for clause (c) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
    “(c) building solely used as schools and Intermediate colleges run and
managed or aided by the State Government;”
(b) for clause (h) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
    “(h) residential buildings occupied by the owner of building, which is
located in such area which has been included in the limit of Corporation
within five years or the facilities of roads, drinking water and street light
provided in the area, which ever is earlier.

10. For section 207 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :- Substitution of section 207

“207. The Municipal Commissioner shall cause areawise rental rates and
an assessment list in the city or part thereof to be prepared from time to
time, in accordance with the manner prescribed in the Rules,”

         Preparation of assessment list

11. After section 207-A of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :- Insection of new section 207-B

 “207-B, (1) For the purposes of Annual rental value, the owner or the



occupier of every house or land shall submit a property return up to a date as
may be prescribed .          Submission of the details of houses or lands for assessment of tax

         (2) Any person failing to submit the return referred to in sub-section
(1) without proper reasons shall be liable to pay penalty as may be pre-
scribed.
         (3) The penalty referred to in sub-section (2) may be compounded
by the Municipal Commissioner.”

12. For section 208 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :-  Substitution of section 208

“208. The Municipal Commissioner shall publish the list prepared under
section 207 in accordance with the manner prescribed in the rules.”

Publication of list

13. For section 209 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :- Substitution of section 209

“209. The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised by him in this
behalf shall dispose off the objections in accordance with the manners
prescribed in the rules.” Objections on proposed rates and list

14. In section 210 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely :- Amendment of section 210

             “(1) The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised by him
in this behalf, shall authenticate by his signature the areawise rental rates
and the assessment list of the city or any part thereof, as the case may
be.”
15. In section 213 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the words

“The Executive Committee or a sub-committee thereof appointed in this be-
half, “ the words “The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised by
him in this behalf “ shall be substituted. Amendment of section 213

16. For section 214 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :-  Substitution of section 214

“214. (1) When any building is constructed or reconstructed or any addi-
tion is made there to by an owner or occupier and the covered area ex-
ceeds by more than 25 per cent then it shall be compulsory for him to
submit its information to the Municipal Commissioner with in sixty days of
the date of completion or date of occupation whichever is earlier, in the
prescribed form.” Obligation to supply informations for purpose of amendment

           (2) The owner or occupiers, who do not submit information referred
to in sub-section (1) without proper reasons, shall be liable to be pun-
ished with fine which may extent to an amount equal to double of the
assessed general tax or Rs. 500.00 per day of the delay whichever is
less.



          (3) The Municipal Commissioner may compound the proposed
penality under sub-section (2).”

VISHNUKANT SHASTRI,
Governor,

Uttar Pradesh.
————————————

By order,
A.B. SHUKLA,

        Pramukh Sachiv

“””


