HNI Tolc, Sk YTl

S} U WRPR ERT YhIRNd

STHTENR ]
faamrfl aRRmye

ART—, TvS (P)
(STR U AT

G, JeMiddR, 9 TgWER, 00
FIfcid 30, 9§Y AH T

IJN U GRBR
fagml arg9rT—q
F&IT 033/ FA8—1d.9—3(P)R—002
SIS N, 003

SRR

fafaer

AU & TTe] 293 @ WU () §RT UId Afddal & YN Fxas, I5gurd
TeIgg o fRed SR Uew TR A (FeNes) JfeuTee, 002 (SR USw
LT F&AT [0 F 003) YU AT & S 39 JERTAAT §RT FAATRIRIT DY
et yHIRE far ST 2 |

SR U TR 9 (F9eE) Qe 00
(SR U JALITQY [T 0 F 003)
MRT TR & fRo9d 99 # IrsguTel §RT UITU)
IR Yo% TR A AR, 9gys &1 R AU A D o

AT

Hfer ITu fagm Aved 95 # TE © 3R ISIUTA BT g FERI B AT ©
& o= aRRefodt faemm § e aRY SR qRea SRR &A1 Tawa &
TIT B
3dYd, JFd WU & AR 93 & WS (A) §RT Uad fdd &I TIRT
PP IogUTA THTIRIT AT TG BRA B
94— T JATY IR U TR A (FNeE) 1T, 007 HET SR |
wfera -




— SR U TR R fSiE, 9gys H, f9 oM qa i s
TAT B, TR I TR AMGR IR P TR ARHR” [T TR AfRTHRY
e TR ARHN TR TRI” "IY TR Y@ "qIRIE IR AHRIGI T8l
Fel W1 oM g, Wiie, Sweiive iR uredeives & R R A AR TR
IYFT” AR TR IYFd” "SY TR JRYdd” “AEFH TR Agad” “HeTuR”
"I HEMUR" “OiE” SR UEl” @ 3 SR |
IR YT ARATIH =T 2 A 98y FT A AEA
3— 7o IAfFA A gRT Y A, @vs (@)@ W R AEfaRed @ve @ fan
SR, ST%ﬁFT — RT Y BT ALe
“(@) 39 JIRATH & dfH i @ foy Fged (@ TR Jgad 3R U& a1
AfId TR TR YA frgad R g |
§— Hol AMRTIA P GgRT 98 $ WM R FrEARIT aRT I@ @ TR, ferfd—

&RT 98 BT gfoReIT=

“qg, (3) STET I IRHR BT I8 A% =4 &1 dROT & o, —
(@) HBTUR IT IU HBTUR B! TP A AU Bl & (UG H PIs gb 8

(@) 7EUR IT SY HAEMUR o, —

(Th) &IRT 99 3R Y # IfectRad P F=dTl SUTT X ol g; IT

(31) URT 9&3 D AT T & ARSI D gRT AT IHDT IR 9,
fosft dfaeT a1 Jarare™ § guer A7 U] wU W AT fhdl YrfieR gRT
HIg AT I7 f2d, T2 o7 T &1 AT Bl o9 UBR @I 1, See )
afSta foar ®; ar

() SIHes AR fH U AWl |, [T SH@T Ucdel a1 e
w7 A 7 f5ft wrfieR g1 318 3w a1 RA 81, aR a8 o9 awa=l 8 a1
Bl o1 geR &1 &1 A1 Bl gafdama, Arfeld a1 o= Afdd @l R o
IHHT dgfcad $U # R o, I AgMUR I7 IU—HEUR I7 gNE & T9 A
S R Bl W 9 |, drd fear g

(@R) | & wdg | |id) T8 (B T 4 & Gy § fedr a9
a7 g fafds wrdarey # ol afad &) iR @ TR v @ faeg o
ST AR 6 faog Ay gt & vu 7 & foar g a1 SuRerd gam
g T fodh v afdd © fog a1 s9e ford e favg TR v T
SHADT MR A ARG HRIare] ARUT 1 T3 81, B fhar 8 a1 SulRerd
BT ©; a1

(ure) T & TRUTfTdT &= # Tue A fard I &1
aRearT ox fear ®; o

(8:) o wfet & fdeT H /aaR BT <Y @7 8 AT

(&) 9 & =16 91 Ydadi drieTd § AR IT SY HEMUR AT
foey afafa & |amafa ar uve @ 9 # a1 fasft o= efraa &, @R o
Al 81, BT HRA Y AU IS BT ST GR FOUINT fhar 8 a1 39 SrerfaH
& el Sudy a1 faft fm, ot ar Sufafyr &1 SMest ) Soaed
far 2 a1 o &1 (e a1 |wafed &1 Ui g1 a1 &f ugemlt 2 o S




HETUR A7 JY ARMUR g9 W&« & 314y 97 <ail &; AT
(313) frlt o= AR &1 TM! & ATe VN1 TR 9 AETUR @
Tq H SU-FEUR & U H I7 g9 & $U #§ fHAr &1 AT
@) frm & Ra & ufdea o fear 8 ar
(@9) 7 3 B 95% § sH UBR | 91 SO Bl § &
T BT S 9% BT B FATAT AT B ST AT VAT R B ford
foel @1 gyuRa fear 8; &
(ORE) 39 A & M AU T 5y AR & fhiT sraw
g1 G &1 g B Soodwd b1 8; AT
(aRE) frma & freTRaT a1 HHaIRA & a1 gaigeR fhar 8 A
(O=B) ™ @1 fod! IR &1 S99 IR 9ed | &9 o8 W
a9 e g Rar 50 AR & el & BIeas; a1
(@ree) fm & 9fA, 9a= a1 el o Srae |vfed R rfasHoT
fhar 8 a1 fell o= =fdq &1 AifdsAvr @ § Agdr & a1 gyuRd
ﬁ?zﬁ%};
ar 98 399 AIfcd H fIfifiye o@fd & iR a8 &Ror 9am @
3T B AT b a7 I US A gl four W |
() I WBR, FETUR IT I AEMUR gRT AT T forel) oot R faarR
A D UG AR T S B D UL o] 98 NMa¥Id: A, BRI Bl
SIAIRIT P I HASMUR T SY HBMUR Bl IFd Ua A gl Fa] |
(3) SUEIRT <) & 3MfH ST TRGR gRT AT TAT BT MY 31f<qH BT 3R
|9 WR B9l rTer | el F8) fhar S |
(¥) SUIRT () @ MEfF BT TIT ARIUR AT SU ABMUR, U¥g W 98] I8
STRIATT 3R SURT (A) & WS () IR (W) # SfeatlRad fhwl MR R g’ oH
@I AT H W8S oM & RATH & g 99 31 37afy dh AR 7 SU HEUR
& w9 H yAfarad &1 U T8 gem |

3—3§rerf€|ﬁwa%am?&ﬁ,— gRT Y BT HLNe

(®) SUuRT () ¥ Qs (4) & e R FEfRad @ve g fear Swm,
i —

“E) 98 A5 PR AT Dl WRHR Ifqar il i
YIS AT o0 WRAR IT el RGN & DA = a1 g=omef=
fedY SuspH a1 Ty &Y Jar § B 3T feRgdae TavHc dre=id arerdm
IR T Fed fSRede Ta-He Hre~id AT Fddi—d AT e 3ferdT
sraafe 4R ST da® RN Holdex &

(@) SUURT (¥) ¥, @ve () & uward fmferlRaa @ve g1 fad S, g

3) e &) P Yo # 39 UBR W IR SO & ® fb
BT S 43P BT BT FaTeTd T 8T ST 1qa] VAT HRd & ford faoefl
B IHAT 8, T

(8) frm & foefl SRy a1 H¥at & T gefaeR fear g ar




(4) y<uer a1 veder wU ¥, fH @ fheft wrfeq o B8 w1 AT
afy ugarh & @1 5 o= afda @ W ey ar afv & fod gla
FRAT B ; AT

(&) fr<l ot @ ford R Y50 WRAR &1 I H, Afdd stemar
TG &, Rigey sermr o |

&—WW@W%Q‘#Z— RT 932 BT FARA

(@) SUURT (3) # I "“TH o BUY” & WM W & Ui oG 9" 3R
Teg “Urd Og TN B M WR IR T g $UY G I IR |
(@) SUERT (3) & Ugard =ferRad SULRT 9@7 <1 ST, srerfd —

“3—%) B VI wfder, Rrad 1 g U 9 &1fed @R g drg vud
H IFE® BT I AU 8l, TR A §RT 99 qP A8l DI SR Sd qb b
Y HAEUR §RT Wigd 7 & a1 s |”
(77) SUERT (g) # veg “Ufg oG BU" & WM R <€ "7 g 9
g fad S ;
(&) SUIRT () # ¥ a9 §OR S0 & WM R I "Th g vud”’
IR T@ TP G I D WM WR & I ARG IR I A S
(8.) SUURT (5) & Uvanq f=ferRad SUeRT do7 < ST, srfd —
(0) TS FRBR ToIC H AR §RIT, SUIRT (3) IT ISULRT (s) AT SULRT (4) A
fafifae anfdie ARl & arrd  gig a1 1 @ rATEegdar R R @t
SeraT @l gfe ® @A gy SuaRd &) addl 2 |7
w—qyrar@rﬁmaﬁquaﬁ:— IRT 93y BT FLMeH
(@) red ¥N¥® # v Ui G IWY B WM R AR T G U
g fed SR |
(@) SULRT (9) # —
(TP) Teg TP IR BUY” B WM W IR 3 oG 39 79
SR
(@) ufdearere wre Nara e S |
(1) SUERT () & gwad feferRad SuaRT 9er &1 SREfT srerid —
“(9—p) AETIR fHefl T 31 S uig oG $ud ¥ 31fSrd 7 &,
Wi < Faar ©
(€) SUEIRT () # v “Ufg oG T & WM R I "TF g 9
g fed SR |

o9l ARFH B GaRT 938 §— I 936 BT e

(@) red ¥N¥d # v Ui oG IWY ® WM R AR T ARG U
g fed SR |

(@) SUIRT (9) § Teg "Ufg g T0” & W R & T ag S
g fad S ;

(77) SUIRT () # WU (P) H, T " NG T B WM W I I




RGBSR XY ey ORI

§—7l ST B GRT v H,— T A0 T

ON ON

(@) @ve (1) & M R fFrEAfaRad @vs @ T SR, siufd —
(@) 9ad, ST 99 WRER ERT Falerd 3R URd ferar derfad Whal 3iR
gUeRHIfEUe draisll & 9 # & wyad B &l ;"

(@) @re (W) & W R FreAafaRad @vs g a7 S, ifd —
() Waq W gRT eATRId AR wal S fhsfl O & # 81, R ufe 9y
@ WIaR e @) e | afafera fear 737 81 d1uar S9 & | ISd, Uaed iR

ARt YHTe BT ALY SUSALS BT <F TS &Y, o W ugd '

Yol AT B gRT 00 B ¥ R Fr=faRad avt @ & S,
3reta — &1RT 209 BT YfIREIIT

“"00—TR AT AHI—F9T R FraamEe 7 fafed Afq & rgar R a1

ISP [l 9RT BT &FaR fHRmar SR SR Mo J= IR SRR |
fefzor = @1 AR fEar S

99— AT BT IRT 0—F & TLAN =g gRT 98T & SIRAf,

Fafg — GRT 00— BT FQMAT ST

00— (9) A¥® fRR & qoa & FAIol & ol UAS 9a= A1 A & @H
1 RN W e dd o fafza foar S U wwfa farel uga & |
() ®Is Afad ST 991 Ifed BRI & ueRT (a) H§ Ffdsme ool uga a1 #
fame <21 81, a8 N wRa & o A @ S, A &R &1 SRl ' |

(3) SUaRT () # s e 2R &1 Yer TR A gRT fbAT S HH T |
R freiRor & ford wamit o fal &1 faaver uvga foear S

R—IA AT P aRT 0c F WM W F=falaa arT v & SR,
JFefd — 8T 0 BT FRRATIT

"oc— TR YT GRT 09 & IJefF TR BT T Gl & ISHRE FRaAmEen o
fafza AT & IgaR M| A BT T

93— SAFRAFMTH BT gRT 0 & WM R FfaRed arT @ <& wREM, steria

IRT 08 T T

"0E—TR AYF AT IFd §RT 39 AT WEgRd DIs dR Femmae o
fafed OfT & IR smufcaal &1 MyerT S| TR SR T S R e

98—l AT BT &RT 90 H, JUART (9) & M R F=falad orT @ @



SRR, drerfa — ETRT 290 HT FATEA
“(9) TR AT T I9D gRT 39 M wiitrqd aIs feary JeriRerfd,

TR T IS (B2 9T B &FaR BT SR 3R MR G o1 o0 gw1erR |

SrfergTaaRd Fa |

y—Hl STAFTIH BT IRT 293 H, JULIRT (A) # W’ “HrISIRof FRAfT srerar gaget

e @ T IHS! BIF STEHTT B WM R AR TR AT I IS §I]

59 i Tilifred @18 e’ 3@ g SR | ST 293 T LT

E—TcT AR B gRT 98 B ¥ W F=ferRead art w@ & SRl srerfa

GIRT 98 DT Ul

“98—(q) 99 AT 9aq w1 AT 1 gAFAT A IHH Bls ORAR
TS WM AT AR gRT fhar S 3R sesTiad 83w 2y Ufaera | o1fdrd 8l
ST, A1 98 99199 @ fQATd @ 31erdT s1earas & fodid @, St WY ugel &1, 316 oA
% HIdR TR AGFd Bl IF6! g1 Afzd o # ifard w9 9 < |
AT & gArel & foIg gam o1 31 qreaar
() VA W AT ey, 1 T S R & IRy (9) H AfdEe gae
URId T8l BRd B, VW AN W, S FEiRT G R @ IAT & GRIER B
FRITRT AT Yoo Bo U S 1 HH B, A& 8 Adhdl &, <ved fhd M & Wil
BT |

(3) TR MY SULRT ) & I URATAd MR BT YLHA B FbT |

faoger @,

NEREIH

IR g2 |

3ITSTT 9,

Yodlo T,
TR A9 |



N0.2032 (2)/XVII-V-I-2(KA)-22-2002
Dated Lucknow, November 21,2002

In pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Con-
stitution, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following
English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam (Sanshodhan)
Adhyadesh, 2002(Uttar Pradesh Adhyadesh Sankhya 20 of 2002 promul-
gated by the Governor.

THE UTTAR PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION (AMENDMENT)
ORDINANCE, 2002
(U.P. ORDINANCE NO. 20 OF 2002)
(Promulgated by the Governor in the Fifty-third Year of the
Republic of India)

AN
ORDINANCE
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959.

WHEREAS the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor
is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take
immediate action ;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause
(1) of Article 213 of the Constitution, the Governor is pleased to promulgate
the following Ordinance :-

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Uttar Pradesh Municipal
Corporation (Amendment) Ordinance, 2002 Short title

2. In the Uttar Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1959, hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act, for the words “Mukhya Nagar Adhikari”, “Apar
Mukhya Nagar Adhikari”, “Upa Nagar Adhikari”, “Sahayak Nagar Adhikari”,
“Nagar Pramukh”, “Upa Nagar Pramukh”, “Sabhasad” and “Sabhasads”
wherever occuring, including headings, Sub- headings and marginal head-
ings, the words “Municipal Commissioner”, “Additional Municipal Commis-
sioner”, “Deputy Municipal Commissioner”, “Assistant Municipal Commis-
sioner”, “Mayor”, “Deputy Mayor”, “Corporator” and “Corporators” shall re-

spectively be substituted. General amendment in U.P. Act No. 2 of 1959
3. In section 5 of the principal Act, for clause (d) the following clause
shall be substituted, namely :- Amendment of section 5

“(d) a Municipal Commissioner and one or more Additional Municipal
Commissioner appointed for the Corporation under this Act.”
4. For section 16 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted namely :- Substitution of section 16
Removal of Mayor and Deputy Mayor -
“16 (1) Where the State Government has, reason to believe that -
(a) there has been a failure on the part of the Mayor or the
Deputy Mayor in performing his duties ;
(b) the Mayor of Deputy Mayor has -



() incurred any of the disqualifications mentioned in section 11
of 25; or

(ii) within the meaning of section 463 Knowingly acquired, di-
rectly or indirectly or by partner, any share or interest, whether pecu-
niary or of any other nature, in any contract or employment with by or
on behalf of the Corporation; or

(iif) Knowingly acted as a Mayor or Deputy Mayor or as a Cor-
porator in matter, in which he has, directly or indirectly or by a partner;
any share or interest whether pecuniary or of any other nature, or in
which he was professionally interested or on behalf of a client, princi-
pal or other person; or

(iv) acted or appeared as a legal practitioner in any suit or
other legal proceeding on behalf of any person against the Corpora-
tion or against the State Government in respect of nazul land en-
trusted to the management of the Corporation, or acted or appeared
for or on behalf of any person against whom a criminal proceeding
has been instituted by or on behalf of the Corporation or,

(v) abandoned his ordinary place of residence in the Municipal
area of the Corporation; or

(vi) been guilty of misconduct in the discharge of his duties; or

(vii) during the current or the preceding term of the Corpora-
tion while acting as Mayor or Deputy Mayor or as Chairperson of a
Committee or as Coporator or in any other capacity whatsoever, so
flagrantily abused his position, or so wilfully contravened any of the
provisions of this Act or any rules, regulation or by-laws made there-
under or caused such loss or damage to fund of property of the
Corporation as to render him unfit to continue to be Mayor or Deputy
Mayor; or

(viii) been guilty of any other misconduct whether committed
as Mayor or as Deputy Mayor; or as a corporator;

(ix) acted againstthe interest of the Corporation; or

(x) created on obstacle in a meeting of the Corporation in
such manner that it becomes impossible for the Corporation to con-
duct its business in the meeting or instigated some one to do so; or

(xi) wilfully contravened any order or direction of the State
Government given under this Act; or

(xi) misbehaved with the officers or employees of the Corpora-
tion; or

(xiii) disposed of any property belonging to the corporation at a
price less then its market value except the directions of state Govern-
ment; or

(xiv) encroached or assisted or instigated any other person to
encroach upon the land, building or any other immovable property of
the corporation.

it may call upon him to show cause with in the time to be specified
in the notice why he should not be removed from office.
(2) After considering any explanation that may be offered by the

Mayor or Deputy Mayor and making such enquiry as it may consider



necessary, the State Government may for the reasons to be recorded
in writing, remove the Mayor or the Deputy Mayor from his office.

(3) An order passed by the State Government under sub-section
(2) shall be final and shall not be questioned in any court of low.

(4) The Mayor or the Deputy Mayor removed under sub-section(2)
shall also cease to be a Corporator and in case of removal on any of
the grounds mentioned in clauses (a) and(b) of sub-section(1) shall
not be eligible for re-election as Mayor or Deputy Mayor for a period of
five years from the date of such removal,”

5. In section 25 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 25
(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (d), the following clause shall be sub-
stituted, namely:-

“(d) isin the service of a State Government or the Central Gov-
ernment or any local authority or any undertaking or body owned or con-
trolled by a State Government or the Central Government or is a District
Government Counsel or an Additional or Assistant District Government
Counsel or an Honorary Magistrate or an Honorary Munsif or an Honor-
ary Assistant Collector”

(b) in sub-section (4), after clause (ii) the following clauses shall be
inserted, namely :-

“(iii) has created an obstacle in a meeting of the Corporation in
such manner that it becomes impossible for the corporation to conduct its
business in the meeting or instigated some one to do so; or

(iv) has misbehaved with any officer or employee of the Corporation;
or

(v) has directly or indirectly caused any loss or damage to any prop-
erty of the Corporation or abets any other person to cause such loss or
damage; or

(vi) is convicted for an offence which, in the opinion of the State Gov-
ernment involves moral turpitude;”

6. In section 132 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 132
(a) in sub section (3), for the words “ one lakh rupees “ the words “ five
lakh rupees” and for the words “five lakh rupees” the words “ten lakh rupees
“ shall be substituted;
(b) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely

“(3-A) No contract involving an expenditure exceeding two lakh ru-
pees and not exceeding five lakh rupees shall be made by the Municipal
Commissioner unless it has been sanctioned by the Mayor.”;

(c) in sub-section (4), for the words” five lakh rupees *, the words “ten
lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-section (5), for the words “fifty thousand rupees” the words
“one lakh rupees” and for the words “one lakh rupees”, the words, “two lakh
rupees “ shall be substituted;

(e) after sub-section (6) the following sub-section shall be inserted namely



“(7) The State Government may, by notification in the Gazette, modify
the monetary limits specified in sub-section (3) or sub-section (4) or sub-
section (5) keeping in view the rise in costs or the exigencies of work and
efficiency of Corporations.”

7. In section 135 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 135

(a) In the marginal heading for words “ five lakh rupees” the words “ten
lakh rupees” shall be substituted.
(b) In sub-section (1),-
(i) for the words “one lakh rupees “ the words “two lakh rupees “
shall be substituted.
(ii) the proviso shall be omitted.
(c) after sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely
(1-A) the Mayor may sanction any estimate not exceeding five lakh
rupees.
(d) in sub-section (2) for the words *“ five lakh rupees” the words “ten lakh
rupees “ shall be substituted.

8. In section 136 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 136

(a) In the marginal heading for the words “five lakh rupees “ the words
“ten lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (1), for the words “five lakh rupees “ the words “ten lakh
rupees” shall be substituted.

(c) in sub-section (2), in clause (a) for the words “ten lakh rupees” the
words “twenty lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

9. In section 177 of the principal Act,- Amendment of section 177
(a) for clause (c) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
“(c) building solely used as schools and Intermediate colleges run and
managed or aided by the State Government;”
(b) for clause (h) the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

“(h) residential buildings occupied by the owner of building, which is
located in such area which has been included in the limit of Corporation
within five years or the facilities of roads, drinking water and street light
provided in the area, which ever is earlier.

10. For section 207 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :- Substitution of section 207

“207. The Municipal Commissioner shall cause areawise rental rates and
an assessment list in the city or part thereof to be prepared from time to
time, in accordance with the manner prescribed in the Rules,”

Preparation of assessment list

11. After section 207-A of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :- Insection of new section 207-B
“207-B, (1) For the purposes of Annual rental value, the owner or the



occupier of every house or land shall submit a property return up to a date as
may be prescribed . Submission of the details of houses or lands for assessment of tax
(2) Any person failing to submit the return referred to in sub-section
(1) without proper reasons shall be liable to pay penalty as may be pre-
scribed.
(3) The penalty referred to in sub-section (2) may be compounded
by the Municipal Commissioner.”

12. For section 208 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :- Substitution of section 208

“208. The Municipal Commissioner shall publish the list prepared under
section 207 in accordance with the manner prescribed in the rules.”
Publication of list

13. For section 209 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :- Substitution of section 209

“209. The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised by him in this
behalf shall dispose off the objections in accordance with the manners
prescribed in the rules.” Objections on proposed rates and list

14. In section 210 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely :- Amendment of section 210

“(1) The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised by him
in this behalf, shall authenticate by his signature the areawise rental rates
and the assessment list of the city or any part thereof, as the case may
be.”

15. In section 213 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the words
“The Executive Committee or a sub-committee thereof appointed in this be-
half, “ the words “The Municipal Commissioner or an officer authorised by
him in this behalf “ shall be substituted. Amendment of section 213

16. For section 214 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :-  Substitution of section 214

“214. (1) When any building is constructed or reconstructed or any addi-
tion is made there to by an owner or occupier and the covered area ex-
ceeds by more than 25 per cent then it shall be compulsory for him to
submit its information to the Municipal Commissioner with in sixty days of
the date of completion or date of occupation whichever is earlier, in the
prescribed form.” Obligation to supply informations for purpose of amendment

(2) The owner or occupiers, who do not submit information referred
to in sub-section (1) without proper reasons, shall be liable to be pun-
ished with fine which may extent to an amount equal to double of the
assessed general tax or Rs. 500.00 per day of the delay whichever is
less.



(3) The Municipal Commissioner may compound the proposed
penality under sub-section (2).”

VISHNUKANT SHASTRI,
Governor,
Uttar Pradesh.

By order,
A.B. SHUKLA,
Pramukh Sachiv



